
WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID TABULATION

HYGIENE PRODUCTS FOR JAIL

ANNUAL CONTRACT  CONTRACT PERIOD: OCT. 1, 2010 TO SEPT. 30, 2011

BID NUMBER: 11WCA016

RECOMMEND AWARD TO:  Universal Home Health

ITEM # DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT QTY.

*American 

Amenities **Aspire Distribution Bob Barker Buy Indian Charm Tex Henry Schein

The Jones Zylon 

Company

Medical 

Warehouse

BASIS xxxxx any or all any or all any or all any or all any or all any or all any or all any or all

DELIVERY TIME xxxxx 5-10 days 5-7 days 5-30 days 5 days 7 days 2-5 days 7-28 days 4-5 days

1 Bath Soap, 3oz Bar each $0.16 $0.17 $0.27 $0.28 $0.27 $0.80 $0.28 $0.20

2 Toothpaste each $0.10 $0.10 $0.14 $0.15 $0.12 $0.16 $0.17 $0.15

3 Toothbrush each $0.03 $0.03 $0.04 $0.06 $0.04 $0.28 $0.44 $0.05

4 Single Blade Razor each $0.05 $0.05 $0.04 $0.06 $0.05 $0.23 $0.08 $0.05

5 Pocket Comb each $0.01 $0.01 $0.02 $0.03 $0.02 $0.04 $0.02 $0.01

6 Sanitary Napkins each $0.05 $0.06 $0.07 $0.26 $0.05 $0.19 No Bid $0.10

7 Clear Shampoo each $0.19 $0.20 $0.30 $0.29 $0.17 $0.26 $0.29 $0.17

Samples no no yes yes yes no no no

Prior Business yes/poor no yes/good no yes/good yes/fair no no

OVERALL TOTALS $0.59 $0.62 $0.88 $1.13 $0.72 $1.96 N/A $0.73

ITEM # DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT QTY. ICS Jail Supply Medical Wholesale Pacific Lodging Robinson Textiles School Health Universal Home US Hygienic Corp Products Unlimited

BASIS xxxxx any or all any or all any or all any or all no indication any or all any or all any or all

DELIVERY TIME xxxxx ***30 days 14 days 7 days 7-30 days 3-5 days 5-7 days 7 days 7 days

1 Bath Soap, 3oz Bar each $0.19 $0.35 $0.20 $0.25 $0.42 $0.18 No Bid $0.47

2 Toothpaste each $0.11 $0.17 $0.12 $0.14 $0.39 $0.11 No Bid $0.33

3 Toothbrush each $0.04 $0.04 $0.04 $0.05 $0.06 $0.04 No Bid $0.72

4 Single Blade Razor each $0.05 $0.07 $0.05 $0.06 $0.06 $0.04 No Bid No Bid

5 Pocket Comb each $0.02 $0.02 $0.02 $0.01 $0.25 $0.01 No Bid $0.02

6 Sanitary Napkins each $0.05 $0.22 $0.17 No Bid $0.19 $0.06 $0.07 No Bid

7 Clear Shampoo each $0.16 No Bid $0.15 $0.37 No Bid $0.19 No Bid No Bid

samples no yes yes no   no yes no  no  

prior Business yes/good no no yes/fair no no no no

OVERALL TOTALS $0.61 N/A $0.75 N/A N/A $0.63 N/A N/A

* American Amenities not considered due to negative purchase history - see attached memorandum for justification

** Aspire Distribution provided incorrect telephone number - see attached memorandum for justification

***ICS Jail Supply 30 days delivery 


