WILLIAMSON COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID # 11WCAO035

CONTRACT PERIOD OCTOBER 19, 2010 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2011

Recommend award to: Kel-Lac— item #1.1-1.3; 1.14; 1.15; 1.17; 1.19; 1.23;

GT Distributors — item# 1.4;1.5; 1.10; 1.11; 1.12; 1.16; 1.18; 1.20; 1.22;

Lonestar Uniforms — item# 1.9; 1.13; 1.21; 2.1;

UNIFORMS FOR WILLIAMSON COUNTY LAW ENFORCEMENT DEPARTMENTS AND CIVILIAN PERSONNEL OF THE SHERIFF’'S OFFICE

Lone Star GT Miller Kel-Lac .
. .. . . SMS Holding Corp.
Uniforms Distributors Uniforms Uniforms
Unaltered Altered Altered Unaltered Unaltered
Item Description Size Price Price Unaltered Price Price Unaltered Price Altered Price Price Altered Price Price Altered Price
Polo Shirt 100% Pigue
Mesh Knit Cotton CH100 Broder
11 6.800zNavy/Blk/Khaki | gm - xxL 24.95 | 24.95 19.5 19.5 18.5 26.5 16.36 18.36 | NO BID NO BID
XXXL 26.95 26.95 22.5 22.5 21.5 31.5 20.28 20.28 | NOBID NO BID
N/A
BDU Trousers unaltered
Propper F5201 60%/40% poly/cotton | Propper F5235
various colors Xsm-XL 26.95 26.95 23.82 cotton/poly 24.5 28.5 19.71 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
1.2
N/A unaltered
60%/40% poly/cotton
XXL 26.95 26.95 23.82 cotton/poly 27 31.5 19.71 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
N/A unaltered
60%/40% poly/cotton
XXXL 28.95 28.95 23.82 cotton/poly 28 32.3 19.71 | NO BID NO BID NO BID




unaltered

N/A
60%/40% | poly/cotton x-
Over cotton/poly x- long 57.00
XXXL 28.95 28.95 23.82 long 49.00 29 33.9 24.43 | NO BID NO BID NO BID
BDU Shirts
65%Poly/35%Cotton N/A
Riptop or 60%/40% unaltered
60%/Cotton/40% Poly Propper F5452 cotton/poly poly/cotton Propper
Variouis colors Xsm-XL 26.95 26.95 23.82 28.5 32.5 F5464 19.71 | NO BID NO BID NO BID
N/A 60%/40% unaltered
cotton/poly poly/cotton
1.3 XXL 26.95 26.95 23.82 31.5 35.5 19.71 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
60%/40% unaltered
N/A
cotton/poly poly/cotton
XXXL 28.95 28.95 23.82 32.3 36.3 19.71 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
60%/40% unaltered
N/A cotton/poly  x- poly/cotton
Over longs 57.00 | x-longs 65.00
XXXL 28.95 28.95 23.82 33.9 37.9 24.43 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
65%poly/35%
Tactical Dress Shirts N/A Cotton, x-longs
SS Propper F5301 47.00
14 various colors Xsm-XL 26.95 26.95 20.82 28.5 | NOBID 23.32 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
XXL 26.95 | 26.95 2082 | N/A 31.5 | NOBID 23.32 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
XXXL 28.95 28.95 20.82 N/A 32.3 | NOBID 23.32 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
Over N/A
XXXL 28.95 28.95 20.82 33.9 | NOBID 23.32 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
Tactical Dress Shirts N/A
LS Propper F5302 S-XL 28.95 28.95 23.82 32.5 | NOBID 26.08 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
various colores
XA 28.95 28.95 23.82 N/A 35.5 | NOBID 26.08 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
XXXL 30.95 | 30.95 2382 | N/A 36.3 | NOBID 26.08 | NO BID NO BID NO BID
Over N/A
XXXL 30.95 30.95 23.82 37.9 | NOBID 26.08 | NOBID NO BID NO BID




Pants Blauer style
#8650 Midnite Navy

&Red striping Men's
15 ELB-E314, 5/8"
’ Red Stripe from
ELC Industries Liberty 640
28-42 36.95 36.95 32.56 32.56 47.5 57.5 MNV 54.27 54.27 | NOBID NO BID
44-50 36.95 36.95 35.82 35.82 52.25 62.25 59.7 59.7 | NOBID NO BID
52-54 36.95 36.95 39.08 39.08 57 67 65.13 65.13 | NOBID NO BID
56 & up 36.95 36.95 42.33 42.33 61.75 71.75 70.55 70.55 | NOBID NO BID
Pants Blauer style
#8650 W
Midnite Navy &Red
striping Women's
ELB-E9314LC,
5/8" Red Stripe
from ELC Liberty 540
sz. 4-18 36.95 36.95 | Industries 32.56 32.56 47.5 57.5 FNV 54.27 54.27 | NOBID NO BID
sz.20 36.95 36.95 35.82 35.82 47.5 62.25 59.7 59.7 | NOBID NO BID
52.22 &24 36.95 36.95 35.82 35.82 52.25 67 59.7 59.7 | NOBID NO BID
sz. 26 36.95 36.95 39.08 39.08 57 71.75 70.55 70.55 | NOBID NO BID
Shirts LS Wht Blauer
style #8431-26 Men's
ELB P877 Sizes
32 reg.14 18-20 +20%, Sizes scratch out-
1.6 5-17 35.25 35.25 22 +40% 25.75 25.75 37.25 37.25 | no price 39.99 | NOBID NO BID
33 HS 1116
reg.14.5- Horace Small
18.5 35.25 35.25 25.75 25.75 46.56 46.56 39.99 39.99 | NOBID NO BID
34
reg.15.5-
18.5 35.25 35.25 25.75 25.75 46.56 46.56 39.99 39.99 | NOBID NO BID




35 reg.

15.5-19.5 35.25 35.25 25.75 25.75 46.56 46.56 39.99 39.99 | NOBID NO BID
37 tall
16.5-19.5 35.25 35.25 30.9 30.9 46.56 46.56 39.99 39.99 | NOBID NO BID
Shirts LS Wht Blauer (sz 32-44) (sz 32-44)
style #8431-26W Women's 37.25 37.25
ELB-P801 (sz46- HS Horace
reg,32-46 35.25 35.25 25.75 25.75 | (sz46-48) 46.56 | 48)46.56 Small 39.99 39.99 | NOBID NO BID
Shirt SS Blauer style #
89107 Silvertan Men's
17 HS 1222
: ELB - 5582 Horace Small
Sm.-XL 44.95 44.95 35.94 35.94 47.75 55.75 41.02 41.02 | NOBID NO BID
XXL 44.95 44.95 43.13 43.13 52.53 60.53 41.02 41.02 | NOBID NO BID
XXXL 44.95 44.95 43.13 43.13 57.3 65.3 47.17 47.17 | NOBID NO BID
XXXXL 44.95 44.95 50.32 50.32 62.08 70.08 49.23 49.23 | NOBID NO BID
Over 4X 44.95 44.95 53.91 53.91 71.63 79.63 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Shirt SS Blauer style #
8910WZ Silvertan Women's
HS 1277
Sm thru ELB-9782 Horace Small
Lg 44.95 44.95 35.94 35.94 47.75 55.75 41.02 41.02 | NOBID NO BID
XL & XXL 44.95 44.95 43.13 43.13 52.53 52.53 47.17 | NO BID NO BID NO BID
Uniform Shirt - LS Blauer
style #8900Z Silvertan Men's
1.8
14 1/2 thru HS 1124
17 1/2 up Horace Small
to 36" 50 50 ELB-582 39.38 39.38 55.75 63.75 47.62 47.62 | NO BID NO BID
18 & 18
1/2 up to
36" SL 50 50 47.26 47.26 61.33 69.33 47.62 47.62 | NO BID NO BID




19 up to

36" SL 50 50 47.26 47.26 66.9 74.9 52.38 52.38 | NOBID NO BID
20 & 38"
SL 50 50 47.26 47.26 72.48 80.48 52.38 52.38 | NOBID NO BID
over 20 50 50 55.14 55.14 83.63 91.63 52.38 52.38 | NOBID NO BID
Uniform Shirt - LS Blauer
style #8900WZ Silvertan Women's
HS 1176
Horace Small
Smthru Lg 50 50 ELB-9582 39.38 39.38 55.75 63.75 47.62 47.62 | NO BID NO BID
XL & XXL 50 50 47.26 47.26 61.33 69.33 52.38 52.38 | NOBID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
Pullov Enf. Shirt Blauer
style #8130 Coolmax Sm. Thru United 570
various colors XL 44 44 | NOBID NO BID 71.5 71.5 60.72 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
19 XXL 76.45 76.45 NO BID NO BID NO BID
XXXL 81.4 81.4 NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
Stretch Patrol shirt
Mocean style #1063 Sm. Thru N/A United 376
midnite Navy XL 43.95 43.95 35.63 (sz28-42)49.5 | NO BID 39 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
1.1
(sz44 &up)56.93 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
Raincoat w/hood Blauer N/A
1.11 style #26990 Midnite Sm. Thru Propper
Navy XL 89.5 89.5 | SPW-S309V 84.83 128.5 | NO BID F5477 190.3 | NO BID NO BID NO BID
XXL 89.5 89.5 84.83 N/A 141.35 | NOBID 190.3 | NOBID NO BID NO BID




N/A

XXXL 89.5 89.5 84.83 154.2 | NOBID 190.3 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
N/A
over XXXL 94.95 94.95 101.79 167.05 | NO BID 190.3 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
N/A Liberty 200
MNV
112 Ties Ladies 4 4 3 5.47 | NOBID 3.85 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
Regular Reg. 4 4 3 N/A 5.47 | NOBID 3.85 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
Long Long 4 4 3 N/A 6.78 | NOBID 3.85 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
x-Long x-Long 4 4 3 N/A 6.78 | NOBID 3.85 | NO BID NO BID NO BID
1.13 N/A
Prop - Nametape
Military Name Strips 1.5 1.5 3.15 3.5 | NOBID 3.25 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
N/A
Gore Tex Jacket Blauer OD Grn-GOW-
style #9625 Drk X-SML thru 71N9,Navy -GOW Navy Only 9910Z- Propper F5475
Navy/OD Grn XL 181 181 -71N134 136.94 04 295 | NOBID 119.68 | NO BID NO BID NO BID
XXL 181 181 136.94 N/A 324.5 | NOBID 119.68 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
114 XXXL 181 181 136.94 | N/A 354 | NOBID 119.68 | NO BID NO BID NO BID
N/A
over XXXL 188.95 188.95 136.94 383.5 | NOBID 119.68 | NO BID NO BID NO BID
1.15 N/A Midnite Liberty
Jacket Blauer style# X -SM thru SPW - S3609 Navy/O.D. Green Millenum
6125 Midnite Navy XL 134.25 134.25 87.25 159.5 | NO BID 85.5 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
XXL 134.25 134.25 87.25 N/A 175.45 | NOBID 98.32 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
XXXL 134.25 134.25 87.25 N/A 191.4 | NOBID 98.32 | NO BID NO BID NO BID
Over XXXL 139.95 139.95 87.25 N/A 207.35 | NOBID 106.87 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
Tactical Pants various
colors #74251 Men's
N/A Propper F5243
28-42 33.95 33.95 28.15 (sz 28-44)39.99 NO BID 29 | NOBID NO BID NO BID




N/A

44-50 33.95 33.95 35.15 (s246-50)39.99 NO BID 29 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
52 & 54 33.95 33.95 3515 | N/A 49.99 | NOBID 29 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
56 & up 43.95 43.95 | NOBID NOBID | N/A NO BID 29 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
1.16 Tactical Pants 5.11 Style
74251 various colors
#64355 Women's
#64355
Discontinued,
Replacement part N/A
#64358
Available in Sizes
2-20, Reg. & Long Propper F5236
sz4-18 33.95 33.95 28.15 39.99 | NO BID 29 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
20 33.95 33.95 28.15 | N/A 39.99 | NO BID 29 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
22 &24 33.95 33.95 | NOBID NOBID | N/A NO BID 29 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
26 43.95 43.95 | NOBID NOBID | N/A NO BID 29 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
Prof. Polo 5.11 style N/A Tru Spec 4330
#41060 Dk. Nvy. X-sm 29.95 29.95 30.49 37.99 | NO BID 25.35 | NO BID NO BID NO BID
117 XXL 29.95 29.95 3049 | N/A 37.99 | NO BID 25.35 | NO BID NO BID NO BID
XXXL 31.95 31.95 33.94 | N/A 43.99 | NOBID 27.6 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
N/A
over XXXL 31.95 31.95 33.94 43.99 | NOBID 27.6 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
Available in
SS Tact Squad item Sm. Thru white and light Liberty 732
#8013 various colors XL 19.95 19.95 blue only 12.18 12.18 22.28 30.28 18.3 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
118 XXL 19.95 19.95 15.36 15.36 22.28 30.28 21.04 | NO BID NO BID NO BID
118 XXXL 19.95 19.95 15.36 15.36 22.28 30.28 21.04 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
over XXXL 19.95 19.95 18.27 18.27 28.96 36.96 21.04 | NO BID NO BID NO BID




1.19 RefectiveTraffic Vest SPW -5912S N/A 5.11, 49001
Blauer style #339 39.95 | 39.95 36.67 53.9 | NOBID 32 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
Windbrkr N/A
LibertyUniform style # Sm. Thru
560 Dk. Nvy. XL 21.95 21.95 13.54 20 | NOBID 14.1 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
XXL 21.95 21.95 15.43 N/A 23 | NOBID 16.2 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
12 XXXL 21.95 21.95 1543 | N/A 25 | NOBID 16.2 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
N/A
over XXXL 24.95 24.95 16.68 26 | NOBID 17.62 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
1.21 N/A
TDU Shirt LS 5.11 OD Sm. Thru OD Grn 511-
GRN XL 33.95 33.95 72002-190 34.03 #72002 4499 | NOBID 37.26 | NO BID NO BID NO BID
XXL 33.95 33.95 34.03 N/A 4499 | NOBID 37.26 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
XXXL 33.95 33.95 37.03 N/A 49.99 | NOBID 37.26 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
N/A
over XXXL 36.95 36.95 37.03 49.99 | NOBID 42.26 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
Nomex Flight Suit Only available in N/A
Propper style #CWU- Sage Green,
CWU-27/P,0D Grn,tan, Short sz. Black, and Tan
black 32-52 134.95 134.95 134.94 153 | NOBID 140.8 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
Reg. sz. 32- N/A
52 134.95 134.95 134.94 153 | NOBID 140.8 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
1.22 Long sz. N/A
32-52 138.95 138.95 134.94 153 | NOBID 140.8 | NO BID NO BID NO BID
N/A N/A
over XXXL 138.95 138.95 202.41 NO BID 140.8 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
1.23
Flex Mesh Cap Navy- KC Cap
Otto style #94-522-004 9.5 9.5 | NOBID NO BID 9.95 | NOBID 6 | NOBID NO BID NO BID




Shirt SS Edwards style

#1027-1 Lt. Blue Men's
sz. 14-17 Red Kap SP80
1/2 12.95 12.95 | NOBID NO BID 20.5 28.5 14.02 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
sz. 18-21
1/2 12.95 12.95 | NOBID NO BID 22.5 30.5 16.83 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
Special Cut
sz 12.95 12.95 | NOBID NO BID 31.5 39.5 16.83 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
Shirt SS Edwards style
5027-01 Lt. Blue Women's
Red Kap SP81
sz. 4-20 12.95 12.95 | NO BID NO BID 20.5 28.5 14.02 | NO BID NO BID NO BID
sz.22-28 12.95 12.95 | NOBID NO BID 22.5 30.5 16.83 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
2.1 Special Cut
Y4 12.95 12.95 | NOBID NO BID 31.5 31.5 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Shirt LS Edwards style
#1077-01 Men's
sz. 14-17 Red Kap SP90
1/2 14.95 14.95 | NOBID NO BID 21.5 29.5 15.67 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
sz. 18-21
1/2 14.95 14.95 | NOBID NO BID 23.5 31.5 18.81 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
Special Cut
sz 14.95 14.95 | NO BID NO BID 32.5 40.5 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Shirt LS Edwards style
#5077 -01 Women's
Red Kap SP91
sz. 4-20 14.95 14.95 | NOBID NO BID 215 29.5 15.67 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
sz.22-28 14.95 14.95 | NO BID NO BID 23.5 31.5 18.81 | NO BID NO BID NO BID
Special Cut
(Y4 14.95 14.95 | NOBID NO BID 325 40.5 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID




All items awarded to low bidder meeting specifications — except item 1.6 awarded to second lowest vendor and items 1.7, 1.8 awarded to third lowest vendor due to
unsatisfactory styling and quality standards.



