


 

 

Contract #T4960 Benefits Broker and Consultant  

Description Annual Consultant Fee  
FY22 - FY24 $85,000.00  
FY25 $89,250.00  

 



CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or
open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

DGibson@holmesmurphy.com
www.holmesmurphy.com

===== Privacy Statement =====​​​​

 
This electronic document including any attachments may contain confidential, privileged, and/or copyrighted information and is intended for use solely by
the intended recipient(s). You are hereby notified that any unauthorized disclosure, copying, distribution, or use of this message is prohibited.  If you
received this message in error, please notify the sender by reply e-mail and permanently delete this message from your computer.
​
​​===== Legal Statement ===== 
​
​Nothing contained herein shall be construed as or constitute legal or tax advice. You have the right to, and should seek the advice of tax or legal counsel
at your own expense.  Third Party information contained in these materials have been compiled and obtained from sources believed to be reliable and
credible but no representation or warranty, express or implied, is made by Holmes Murphy, or any of its subsidiaries or affiliates, as to their accuracy or
completeness.

 ==========================
 
Please be advised: Coverage cannot be bound without the acknowledgment of a licensed staff member.
Corporate Address:  2727 Grand Prairie Parkway, Waukee, IA  50263

From: Cheryl Johnson <cheryl.johnson@wilco.org> 
Sent: Thursday, August 01, 2024 2:26 PM
To: David Gibson <DGibson@holmesmurphy.com>
Cc: Shelley Loughrey <sloughrey@wilco.org>; Purchasing Contracts
<purchasing.contracts@wilco.org>
Subject: FW: Benefits Broker and Consultant-Holmes Murphy & Associates, LLC-T4960

 

 

 

Good morning, Mr. Gibson

After reviewing the contract for Benefits Broker and Consultant-Holmes
Murphy & Associates, LLC-T4960, I have found that it is due for renewal. The
current expiration date for this contract is 31 Dec 2024. Shelley has informed
us that there has been an approved increase in the annual contract amount to
$89,250.00. Please confirm via this message if you would like to renew this
contract with the County by completing the attached Renewal Form, Form
1295 (see attached), and providing an updated Certificate of Insurance (if
applicable), and documentation substantiating the increase.

 



Please do so at your earliest convenience. 

 
Warmest regards,
 
Cheryl Johnson
Contract Specialist
office: 512.943.1478 
cheryl.johnson@wilco.org
100 Wilco Way, Georgetown, TX 78626
www.wilcotx.gov

 
 

 

 
 
 
From: Cheryl Johnson <cheryl.johnson@wilco.org> 
Sent: Thursday, July 25, 2024 12:07 PM
To: Shelley Loughrey <sloughrey@wilco.org>
Cc: Purchasing Contracts <purchasing.contracts@wilco.org>
Subject: Benefits Broker and Consultant-Holmes Murphy & Associates, LLC-T4960

 
Good morning,
 
After reviewing the contract Benefits Broker and Consultant-Holmes Murphy
& Associates, LLC-T4960. I have found that it is due for renewal. The current
expiration date for this contract is 31 Dec 2024. Do you intend to renew it?  I
will contact the vendor if so.
 
Please let me know if you have further questions.
 
 

Warmest regards,
 
Cheryl Johnson
Contract Specialist
office: 512.943.1478 
cheryl.johnson@wilco.org
100 Wilco Way, Georgetown, TX 78626
www.wilcotx.gov



 
 

 

 




